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We report the case of a 63-year-old female with 
history of hypertension, who presented to our 
echocardiography laboratory to undertake 
preoperative cardiac ultrasound before 
undergoing cholecystectomy. In her medical 
history, the patient complained from episodes of 
palpitations for 1 month, with no stroke or 
embolic event. Physical examination was normal. 
Electrocardiogram showed atrial fibrillation (AF) 
that was never discovered before. Transthoracic 
Echocardiography (TEE) revealed a large round 
mass freely floating in a dilated left atrium (LA) 
measuring 24x20, with no attachment to the 
interatrial septum. The mass was not very mobile 
and didn´t prolapse in the left ventricle, and 
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wasn´t obstructive (mean gradient = 4mmHg), only 
a mild mitral regurgitation was found (A,B). 
Considering the presence of AF in addition to the 
mass free-floating movement in the LA, we 
concluded that it was more likely a thrombus, 
rather than a cardiac tumour. Thus, 
antithrombotic therapy with heparin was initiated. 
After 1 month of treatment, the mass remained 
unchanged with no reduction of its size, the 
diagnosis was then reconsidered. We performed a 
Computed Tomography Angiography (CTA) that 

found a left atrial hypointense mass with no other 
thrombi elsewhere. The patient underwent 
surgery, and a large smooth spherical pink colored 
mass was removed, compatible with a diagnosis of 
cardiac tumor. It was then confirmed by 
anatomopathological examination that it was an 
atrial myxoma. The postoperative follow-up was 
uneventful and the patient was discharged from 
the hospital with no sign or residual tumor in the 
control TEE. 

 

 

 

Figure 1: (A,B) transthoracic echocardiography showing a large round 

mass free-floating in a dilated left atrium with no attachments to the 

interatrial septum, associated to a mild mitral regurgitation 

 


